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Dispute forces Lewis to move 
By Randee Bayer-Spittel 

SENIOR STAFF WRITER 

Another conflict erupted 
last week between the Ameri­
can Federation of Teachers 
(AFT) and the administration 
over the removal of Karen 
Lewis, acting Residence Direc­
tor, Hillside, from an apartment 
in Heritage Hall. Lewis was 
removed as part of a contractu­
al dispute with the college that 
the Council of State College 
Locals, AFT is representing her 
in. 

In response, the AFT dis­
tributed a flier explaining the 
removal which was followed 
by a three page memo from 
President Speert three days lat­
er. 

The dispute originated 
when Karen Lewis was hired 
last year as an Acting Resident 
Director, Hillside. According 
to Robert Bing, AFT vice pres­
ident, Lewis was issued a per­
manent contract instead of one 
specifying temporary employ­
ment. Raj Singh, assistant vice 
president of human resources 
does not deny that Lewis was 
issued a permanent contract. 

"At that time we were not us­
ing separate contracts," he said. 

However, Bing contends 
that the state had mandated 
separate contracts. "We filed a 
grievance about this over the 
summer because we had not re­
alized that the college was not 
following the state mandate 
and they do use separate con­
tracts now." 

The AFT contends that the 
next mistake in handling the 
situation came last December 
when Lewis was given a "re­
tention evaluation." In order to 
be retained for the following 
year, employees are evaluated 

on a number of levels, culmi­
nating in approval by the Board 
of Trustees. In Lewis' case her 
evaluation was signed by Ann 
Deighan, area coordinator for 
Pioneer then passed on to and 
signed by: Joseph Caffarelli, 
associate director, resident life; 
Roland Watts, assistant dean of 
students and director residence 
life; and Henry Krell, dean of 
students and was then passed 
onto the President's Office, ac­
cording to Bing. 

Singh said that all employees 
are evaluated, including tempo­
rary ones, but that the evalua-
SEE MISTAKES PAGE 5 |College worker removing Lewis' belongings. 

USNJ lobbies to gain WPC 
By Brenda Sanabria 

STAFF WRITER 

Returning to WPC on Oc­
tober 11 to attend a Student 
Government Association Leg­
islature meeting, Staci Berger 
attempted to encourage the 
SGA to join the United Stu­
dents of New Jersey (USNJ) as 

a paying member. 
Berger, executive director 

of USNJ, made the same ap­
peal during her last attendance 
at an SGA meeting on August 
17. She returned at the request 
of SGA President Lorraine 
Doumato to clarify a number of 
issues. 

Before the meeting began, 

Vacant SGA positions filled 
By Bobi Lee Messer 

NEWS CONTRIBUTOR 

The Freshman "Fall 1994" 
Elections officially came to a 
close Wednesday, October 12. 
In the end, only a total of 102 
votes were cast for freshmen 
candidates. 

Fifty-four votes were cast in 
favor of Michael Pezzillo, the 
newly-elected freshman class 
president. Pezzillo won by a 
margin of 32 votes. 

After being notified of his 
election, Pezzillo stated, "I 
want to thank all of the people 
who actually took the time out 
to vote for me. I'm looking 
forward to making this the best 
freshman class possible. I want 

everyone to feel free to come 
and speak to me about any­
thing, or just say hello." 

"I want to say thank you to 
all of my new friends who vot­
ed for me. I promise to do the 
best job I can," said Nadia So-
han, who was elected vice pres­
ident, receiving 59 of the 102 
votes cast. 

Jeannie Robles, who walked 
away with the position of trea­
surer, stated, "Thank you to ev­
eryone who voted for me. I 11 
try to do my best." Robles re­
ceived 57 of the total votes 
cast. 

Jasmine Lopez was elected 
secretary. Lopez ran unop­
posed and received 84 of the 
total votes cast. 

A number of other positions 
were filled. For the senior 
class, Kim "Khemi" Freeman 
was elected secretary. Tyhesha 
White was elected class trea­
surer. 

The junior class office of 
vice-president was won by 
Richard "Sam" Ortiz. The po­
sition of junior class secretary 
was not filled. 

Kim Cristiano and Jennifer 
Wolak were both elected as 
representatives for the school 
of arts and communications. 

Five Club B representatives 
were elected; they include 
Sheila Etienne, Thaddeus 
Krupo, Anthony Kroposky, 
Jamie Summers, and Ronald 
Thompson. 
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Berger handed out copies of 
two recent newspaper articles 
concerning higher education 
funding and USNJ membership 
information booklets. 

Forty-five minutes into the 
meeting following the first 
guest speaker (WPC President 
Arnold Speert), Berger, who 
was accompanied by USNJ Or­
ganizing Director Gena Guerri-
eri, opened her discussion by 
stating she was seriously mis­
quoted in the previous Beacon 
article written about USNJ, but 
did not have time to send a let­
ter to the Beacon regarding the 
matter. 

She then discussed how 
the present Commission of 
Higher Education and Presi­
dents Council, which have re­
placed the defunct Department 
of Higher Education, are the 
two organizations USNJ will 
lobby. They will continue, as 
they have in the past, to lobby 
the New Jersey Legislature. 
According to Berger, there are 
currently 15 people on the 
commission, which is also sup­
posed to include two students 
whom have not been appointed 
vet. The commission also in­
cludes no professional educa­
tors. 

No one on the Commis­
sion has the experience the 
Board of Higher Education 
had," she said. 

Berger then pointed out 
that USNJ's main objective is 
to fight for increased funding 
of state colleges, and that there 
has been a seven-year gap in 
the funding. USNJ also will 
fight the commission's plans to 
lower the number of Educa­
tional Opportunity Fund (EOF) 
and Tuition Aid Grant (TAG) 
recipients. 

When Alfonso Pardo, SGA 
vice president, asked if USNJ 
is still a lobbying organization, 
Berger responded by saying, 
"We have always been a lobby­
ing organization. What Delia 
Sosa (WPC representative to 
the USNJ Board of Directors) 
does by traveling to Trenton is 
lobbying." 

When asked which other 
colleges have already joined 
USNJ, Berger said that, "Three 
SGA's have already turned 
over their money to USNJ. 
They are Livingston College of 
Rutgers University, New Jersey 
Institute of Technology Gradu­
ate Students, and Rowan Col­
lege." She added that having 
SEE SGA PAGE 7 



Campus Events 
Monday 

Career Services—Workshop? 
"INTERNSHIP OPPORTUNI­
TIES" Oct. 17, 5-6pm SC 324-
325 
Catholic Campus Ministry— 
Join us for weekly visits to the 
Preakness Nursing Home & 
make a difference in others' 
lives on 6:30pm CCM Center 
Gate 1. Call Joanne at 595-
6184 for more info. 
WCRN— Mid-day monster 
with the Nooseman making 
short shrift of your synapses 
with Obituary, Prong, Biohaz-
ard, and legendary Slater. The 
best radio on TV. Crank it. 
Channel 20 12-3pm. 
Newsline— Is the WPC televi­
sion news station providing the 
entire Passaic County with the 
latest in campus news, local 
news, state and national news, 
sports, weather, and entertain­
ment, Mon & Thurs. at 5:30pm 
on Channel 18&19. 
Pioneer Yearbook— Anyone 
wishing to join the yearbook 
staff is welcome. Please con­
tact the SGA office at 595-
2747 or drop a note in the Pio­
neer Yearbook mailbox. 

Tuesday 

CCMC— Do you have the 
heart to teach the mentally 
handicapped? Come & experi­
ence the joy of this special out­
reach as we visit North Jersey 
Developmental Center- 6:30pm 
Tues. CCM Center 

Wednesday 

Phosphorus- The Multicul­
tural Network— Spiderwom-
an Theater, Wed, Oct 19th 
12:30pm to 2pm SCB. For 
more info call 595-3061. 
Career Services—Workshop: 
"CAREERS IN BIOLOGY, 
BIOTECHNOLOGY" Oct. 19, 
11-12 pm Science 319, Work­
shop: "RESUME WRITING" 
1 l-12:30pm SC 213 
Christian Fellowship— Small 
group for fun, fellowship, and 
Bible study on Wed. 11am & 
12:30pm SC 302. 
WCRN—Check out the #1 ra­
dio show on WCRN(19)~ "The 
Bomb" with DJ's Little Nation 
and the X-Man. Wednesday & 
Fridays, 12-3pm. Rap, Reggae, 
R&B. The new flava in ya ear! 
Student Council for Excep­
tional Citizens-SCEC is hav-' 
ing a meeting for first time 
members. We'll discuss future 
events and programs for the 
disabled adults and children. 
Stop by, bring a friend, check 
us out on Oct. 19, Wed, SC 312 
3:30-5:00pm. 

Thursday 

Career Services—Workshop: 
"RESEARCHING EMPLOY­
ERS FOR THE JOB 
SEARCH" Oct.20, 11-12:30 
pm Wing 233. 
Christian Fellowship— 9:30; 
1 lam; 12:30pm Thurs. SC 302, 
small group for fun, fellowship 
and Bible study. 

10 TILT ST. 
HALEDON, N.J. 
TELEPHONE 790-7373 
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$5 per tan 

\1X' 

f t  
: / . ., s\ 

P C  S t u d e n  t  
S p e c i a l s  "  ;.\ 

Cuts 
Women-$15 
Men -$12 

IMS 
Manicure $8 
Wraps $35 
Tips/Wraps $45 

Must Show Student Id 

United Asian Americans-
Support the United Asian 
Americans in their Bake Sale. 
Lots of food and fun for you 
all! And if you are cold, hot co­
coa, tea, and coffee for you to 
drink. Oct. 20, 7-12:30pm, 
Hunziker Wing. 

Friday 

Catholic Campus Ministry-
God speaks to us through scrip­
ture. Come & hear what He has 
to say to you as we informally 
gather to study His words. 3:00 
p.m., CCM Center Gate #1 

Sunday 

Catholic Campus Ministry— 
In need of some spiritual rest & 
relaxation? Join us for 
exposition of the blessed sacra­
ment as we gather in the Lord's 
presence in prayer & medita­
tion. All are welcome & bring 
a friend! Sun. Oct. 16 6pm 
CCM Center Gate #1. 
CCMC— Join us for Sunday 
Mass at 7:30pm CCM Center 
Gate 1 for good times of faith, 
fellowship & fun! Bring a 
friend! Transportation is avail­
able. For further info call 
Joanne at 595-6184 

FUTURE 

North Jersey Blood Center/ 
Blood Drive— North Jersey 
Blood Center is sponsoring a 
blood drive Tues. Oct 25th 
through Thurs. Oct. 27th, 
10am-7pm. Please give the gift 
of life! For more info contact 
Janet Barone-Desenzo 595-
2714 
Halloween Fest— The Mis­
sionary Sisters of the Immacu­
late Conception, 44 Riflecamp 
Rd. (continuation of Squirrel-
wood Rd., Berkely Campus) 
will be sponsoring a Halloween 
Fest Sun, Oct. 30th, 9am-5pm. 
Trick or treaters are welcomed. 
There will be over 100 ven­
dors, DJ Jason, pony rides, 
popcorn, cotton candy, and a 
children's Halloween Parade 
beginning at 12pm with valu­
able prizes for the winners. For 
info call Joe or Ariene Jiuliani 
(201)977-8134 
Octoberfest— Sat. Oct. 22nd 
from 5:30pm-8:30pm SCB. 
D Phi E—Sponsoring Lipsync 
on Nov.l, Student Center Ball­
room, 7:30pm. 
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Registration to be made touch-tone 
By Yoni Greenbaum 

NEWS EDITOR 

"I don't know a lot about it" 
said junior Stacey Munsey, 
when asked about the new 
Voice Response Registration. 

"We're offering a sneak pre­
view of the system one-hour a 
week" said WPC Registrar 
Mark Evangelista. "Students 
can stop our office in Raub-
inger Hall and try it out." [See 
accompanying list of dates and 
times]. 

Evangelista, who has been 
with the college for over 20 
years, "wants students to know 
that the new system is designed 
to help them." 

"Students are going to have 
to prepare for it," Evangelista 
said about the new system. 

Students are going to have to 
know their obligations, "If 
there are any types of holds on 
their accounts, they won't be 
able to register" he said. A 
hold can be placed for either, 
lack of payment or unsatisfac­

tory academic progress. 
"While in the past, students 

might have been able to regis­
ter for Spanish II without tak­
ing Spanish I, this new system 
checks the pre-requisites and 
will notify you," he said. 

Another change students will 
notice is the removal of the 

'Students 
could even 
register from 
the beach' 
- Evangelista 

standard five days at the begin­
ning of the semester for 
add/drop. "When it starts on 
November 7," Evangelista said, 
"students will be able to both 
register and add/drop all the 
way up until January 20." 

"The last issue students need 
to be aware of is the purge" 

Evangelista said. "Students 
who haven't satisfied their fi­
nancial obligations by the De­
cember 21st deadline, will be 
removed from classes" he said. 
They will be allowed to re-reg­
ister at a later date, "but, on a 
seat-availability basis." 

This new technology, created 
by Periphonics in New York, 
features a female voice that 
,"will guide students through 
the choices," Evangelista ex­
plained. WPC will become 
only the third college in New 
Jersey to offer this type of au­
tomated system. 

There will be 20 telephone 
lines available, 15 hours a day, 
7 days a week. "Students could 
even register from the beach," 
Evangelista said. 

"We are not trying to put stu­
dents at a disadvantage," he 
said. "We want to put them at 
an advantage." 

The national average for col­
leges using this system is three 
phone calls per student with 
12-15 minutes per call. "You 

Res. Life prepares 
for staff changes 

By Yoni Greenbaum 
NEWS EDITOR 

After working in a dual ca­
pacity of Assistant Dean of 
Students and Director of Resi­
dence Life for the past two 
years, Roland Watts will as­
sume the full-time responsibili­
ties of Assistant Dean of Stu­
dents on Monday, October 17. 

"After 5 years of working in 
Residence Life, it has been en­
joyable, exciting and reward­
ing," said Watts. "I very much 
look forward to the opportunity 
to work with a broader segment 
of our student population." 

For the past two years, 
Watts, in his 9th year at WPC, 
alternated his weekdays with 
two days spent working out of 
the Dean of Students Office 
and the remaining three at Res­
idence Life. Starting on Mon­
day, he will be working solely 
out of the Dean of Students of­
fice, located in Matelson Hall 
room 161. 

"[It's been] difficult to re­
spond to some issues in the 
way I want to respond," said 
Hank Krell, dean of students. 
"[Roland's move] will relieve 
me of some of these responsi­
bilities." 

Watts will be overseeing 
Residence Life and Campus 
Activities/Campus Events. 

"I will also be working clos­
er with Don Phelps (greek ad­
visor) and the Greek communi­
ty," said Watts. 

In addition, Watts will be 
continuing as the College's Ju­

dicial officer. 
Taking the place of Watts in 

Residence Life will be associ­
ate director Joseph Caffarelli. 

Caffarelli came to the college 
five years ago from Seton Hall 
where he had served four years 
as associate director of resi­
dence life for conferencing and 

Voice Registration 1 OpenTrlourft 
DAY DATE 1 i X IMJtv 

Wednesday October 19 10:30-11:30 am 
j Monday October 24 10:30-11:30 am 
Thursday October 27 3:30-4:30 poa 
Monday October 31 10:80-11:30 am 
Tuesday November 1 10:300,1:30 am 

Wednesday November 9 10:30-11:30 am 
Thursday November 17 
Monday November 21 10:30-11:30 am 

Available voice registration test dates and times. 

facilities. 
In his role as director, Caf­

farelli will be responsible for 
the selection, training and de­
velopment of all resident assis­
tant and resident directors. 

"As Director, I will be deal­
ing with a wider variety of is­
sues," said Caffarelli. 

"Right now, we are at a point 
in time where things are going 
well," said Caffarelli. "I hope 
to build on those things." 

Residence Life is constantly 
looking "at what else we can 
provide," Caffarelli said. "The 
24-hour security was an at­
tempt to provide more for stu­
dents." 

Patricia "Trish" Whiteman, a 
member of the residence life 
staff for the past 8 years, will 
be moving up to the position of 
associate director. 

Caffarelli wants students to 
know that his "door has always 
been open and continues to be; 
so if you have any questions or 
comments, stop by and ask." 

The Office of Residence Life 
is located on the D floor of the 
North Tower. 

will not be on forever" Evange­
lista said. 

When students call up, they 
will be welcomed to the Voice 
Response Registration [VRR] 
system. They will then be 
asked for their social security 
number, and their personal 
identification number (birth-
date). Students then will be 
asked which semester they 
would like to register for (i.e., 
Fall, Spring, Summer). 

When registration begins on 
November 7, 1994, students 
will notice some changes and 
additions have been made to 
the master schedule. The main 
change will be, in how courses 
are identified. "Courses won't 
be labeled Eng 110 anymore," 
said Evangelista. "Course call 
Number will now be used to 
identify classes." In an attempt 
to assist students in using this 
new system, the Registrar has 
included a work-sheet in the 
Master Schedule. "If students 
fill this out, they shouldn't 
have any problems," he said. 

In addition to allowing stu­
dents register, they will also 
have the option of addressing 
payment issues. "Credit card 
payments can be arranged right 
over the phone," Evangelista 
said. 

As a result of this new tech­
nology there will be a number 
of changes for students to get 
used to. "It will be more diffi­
cult to get into closed classes," 
Evangelista told the Beacon. 
Students will no longer need 
closed course enjry permission 
slips. "The departments will 
electronically provide autho­
rization," Evangelista said. 

"There are going to be some 
people who can't get into a 
class at a given time and will 
feel annoyed," Evangelista 
said. "We [the registrars of­
fice] strive very hard to service 
[students'] academic needs; it's 
their personal needs that are 
difficult to accommodate." 

The Registrars' office han­
dles the offering of 1,400 un­
dergraduate sections. In addi­
tion they process about 20,000 
transcripts and 50,000 grades a 
semester. 

"We tried to cover as much 
as we could, and be as prepared 
as we can be," Evangelista 
said. "There will be some 
things that we haven't thought 
about, but we will be available 
to help students any way we 
can." 

The Registrars office is lo­
cated in Raubinger Hall room 
118 and can be reached by 
phone at 595-2305. 

9 
% 



r  
4 

SPONSORED BY GREEK SENATE 

Campus Police: more than meets the eye 
By Rosa Cirianni 

STAFF WRITER 

Campus police, consisting of 
57 employees, is divided up 
into divisions of traffic, patrol, 
detective bureau, administra­
tion and violations bureau. 

The main employees stu­
dents come into contact with 
are Police Officers, Security 
Officers, Dormitory Security 
Guards, and Parking Lot Atten­
dants. 

Police officers' uniforms 
consist of a light blue shirt and 
dark blue slacks. They patrol 
in marked police cars and on 
foot. 

Security officers wear brown 
uniforms and patrol the campus 
in marked cars and on foot. 
They have direct radio contact 
with police headquarters, re­
porting suspicious or criminal 
activity, and providing assis­
tance to members of the college 
community are a few of the du­
ties of the officers. 

Dormitory Security Guards 
wear brown uniforms and are 
stationed at the entrance of 
each residence hall assuring the 
safety and security of the stu­
dents. 

Parking lot attendants are 
stationed in various parking 
lots on campus. They wear 

brown uniforms and are re­
sponsible for maintaining order 
in the lots. 

Salaries for campus police 
employees start at $31,000 and 
may increase over a period of 
five years at a rate of one step 
per year (increase is negotiated 
at state levels). 

"We get our officers off of 
the civil service list. They (of­
ficers) are trained for 22 weeks 
in physical fitness, traffic laws, 
stress management, emergency 
reaction and firearms," stated 
Lt. Stephen Adams. 

To qualify as a patrolman, 
psychological education, crimi­
nal laws, physical training, and 
civil service must be in one's 
background, added Ptl. Dave 
Tartza. 

WPC campus police officers 
are frustrated because they feel 
they cannot provide protection 
for the community on campus, 
according to Tartza. 

"Police have to be armed to 
do their job; they have been 
trained and earned their right to 
be armed. We are on the stu­
dents' side," he said. 

"[The] seriousness of inci­
dents has increased, but the 
number of cases has not in­
creased," stated Lt. Joseph 
Henderson. 

"All our officers are trained 

at a police academy and are 
legally permitted to carry a 
firearm," stated Sgt. Michael 
Seaman, a 14 year veteran of 
the force. 

"But because we work for a 
state college of New Jersey, 
only WPC administration can 
authorize us to carry guns on or 
off duty. It's scary and frustrat­
ing for us to try to do our job 
without the equipment to do it. 
We don't get respect from oth­
er fellow police officers off 

series 

campus or from students here 
on campus," added Seaman. 
[Beacon October 10, 1994], 

Henderson says the adminis­
tration feels that students 
would feel safer knowing that 
officers are walking around un­
armed. 

"When that phone rings, we 
do not know if it is a complaint 
or something of more serious 
nature," stated Henderson. 
"This is no fantasy island," he 

added. 
"Officers are scheduled 

twice a year for firearms con­
trol," stated Henderson. Last 
year WPC placed third among 

local municipalities as a strong 
shooting pistol team, added 
Henderson. 

"There are many incidents 
involving alcohol," said 
Adams. "People are not think­
ing the same way when they 
are sober." 

He said first aid calls, van­
dalism, theft, and possession of 
illegal drugs are a few of the 
situations that WPC police 
have handled. 

WPC police are also in­
volved in many activities in the 
community, added Henderson. 

Ptl. Joe Mourao, is a certi­
fied blackbelt and will conduct 
a rape-awareness program in 
conjunction with Residence 
Life, the Women's Center and 
the Rec Center. This event will 
take place in the near future, 
according to Henderson. 

A seat-belt training program 
for the Child Care Center on 
campus takes place annually. 

"We've had great success 
with that program; the children 
love it," stated Tartza. 

Sgt. Robert Mac Farlane is 
the coordinator of the New Jer­
sey Special Olympics (when he 
is off duty), which takes place 
at Trenton State College bi-an-
nually. 

"We have officers who have 
taken courses here on campus," 

said Henderson. We encourage 
meeting students he added. 

Another officer is in the pro­
cess of obtaining a Master's de­
gree in psychology at NYU. 

"We want to be more well 
rounded," said Adams. "A col­
lege campus is different than 
working in a town; people 
come in and out, so you don't 
always have a chance to form 
relationships with these stu­
dents," he said. 

He added that President 
Speert "has been very support­
ive of us." 

WPC is situated within por­
tions of three political jurisdic­
tions: Wayne, Haledon, and 
North Haledon. Those police 
departments are not called 
upon unless WPC needs back­
up , according to Tartza. 

"We exist to help out stu­
dents. Students should not be 
afraid to contact us," added 
Adams. 

Campus police are on duty 
24 hours-a-day, seven days a 
week, working in three time 
shifts. 

In case of an emergency or to 
report a crime contact 595-
2301. Call 595-2300 for non­
emergencies. For information 
regarding violations, call 595-
3001, Monday-Friday, 8:30 
a.m. - 4:30 p.m. 



Mistakes ever Lewis lead to court 
FROM DISPUTE PAGE 1 

tion should only go to the de­
partment level. "The evalua­
tions are used so that we have 
some record if the employee 
ever applies for another posi­
tion. Someone, in error, wrote 
'recommended for reappoint­
ment' on the evaluation, it 
came into my office and she 
was put on the list of 20 or 30 
other people who got reap­
pointed," Singh added. 

The Board of Trustees then 
approved Lewis and she was is­
sued a contract for the 1994-
'95 academic year, said Singh. 

According to the AFT, 
Lewis went to Cafarelli and 
asked about the contract and 
was told that he thought it 
might be a mistake; he would 
look into it and get back to her. 
"He [Cafarelli] never got back 

to her. He admitted it in front 
of myself, Karen [Lewis], Bar­
bara Hoerner, staff representa­
tive of the State College Lo­
cals, AFT and Roland Watts. 
[Cafarelli said,] 'I dropped the 
ball, I didn't get back to her.' 
Since the contracts have to be 
signed within 10 days, she 

but he understood, he left," he 
said. 

According to Bing, Lewis 
was later told that a search 
should have been done but it 
would be "pro forma", simply a 
matter of formality. According 
to two administrative sources, 
she submitted a resume for the 

employee. 
Singh said that she got that 

letter simply because "the posi­
tion has been moved from a 10-
month to a 12-month position 
and she occupied the position 
at the time." 

"If they had not intended 
to keep her on staff, why was 

7 don't know if the Towers are comparable 
housing; I've never been there' 

Singh 
signed it and returned it," said 
Bing. 

Singh disagrees, stating 
that Cafarelli told her that it 
was a mistake. "Travis Ce-
phus, another individual in a 
similar situation [former acting 
resident director, Towers] was 
also issued a contract in error 

search and included the Acting 
Resident Director title under 
her job experience. 

Bing agrees that she did 
submit for the search and was 
awaiting her interview when 
she got a letter saying that she 
had been moved from a 10 
month employee to a 12 month 

Unions unite 
for rally 
By Randee Bayer-Spittel 

STAFF WRITER 

The removal of Karen 
Lewis from her campus apart­
ment, combined with the unfair 
labor practice charges filed by 
President Speert, has sparked 
the four unions on campus to 
schedule a rally for Tuesday at 
2 p.m. on the Student Center 
lawn. 

"This is just the tip of the 
iceberg," said Victor Cirello, 
President of Local 195 of the 
IFPTE, "We have had it. This 
incident is just the straw that 
broke the camel's back. We 
don't care if we lose our jobs 

over this." 

The four unions consist of 
the American Federation of 
Teacher (AFT), who represent 
faculty and some professional 
staff members, the College 
Workers Association (CWA), 
representing secretaries, library 
clerks; the Police Benevolent 
Association (PBA), represent­
ing the colleges police officers; 
and the IFPTE, who represent 
the colleges general workers. 

William Blauvelt of the 
CWA has confirmed their sup­
port for the rally, saying that 
the unions were pulling togeth­

er. 

Linda Dye, president of 
the WPC-AFT, said all four 
campus unions were supporting 
the rally. "They are all sup­
porting it, but it's a matter of 
the membership being able to 
get to the rally. Norma Levy 
has called a training session for 
Tuesday at 2 p.m. for the 
librarians and the secretaries, 
and maintenance personnel 
have been told that they may 
take lunch between noon -1 
p.m. and 12:30 and 1:30. They 
have no flexibility in their 
schedules. What we need is a 
big turnout from our students." 
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she sent a letter by President 
Speert appointing her to the 
AIDS Task Force for '94/'95? 
Why would Roland Watts have 
signed off on vacation for her 
in August when her contract 
would have been up in July? 
Would they do that if they 
thought she wouldn't be back?" 
counters Bing. 

Since the position had 
been extended to 12 months, 
Lewis's contract was extended 
by two months also extending 
her employment in July. When 

she went on vacation in August 
and received a call telling her 
that she did not have the posi­
tion, she then went to the 
union, said Bing. 

The memo distributed by 
President Arnold Speen on Oc­
tober 12 said that the matter 
was postponed several times by 
the union. Bing denies this 
stating that the matter was orig­
inally scheduled for a hearing 
this past summer, but the date 
was postponed because the 

' state was not ready to present 
its case and had not handed 
their paperwork into the judge. 

"We sought a Temporary Re­
straining Order, so that Karen 
[Lewis] could remain in her 
apartment," Bing said. He said 
that they subsequently with­
drew their request for a re­
straining order when the 
lawyers for both „sides reached 
an agreement in front of the 
judge at an October 3rd hear­
ing. At that time the judge sug­
gested arbitration, since he 
could not hear the case until 
December. Both parties agreed 
to binding arbitration in front 
of a retired judge, scheduled 
for Oct. 19. The agreement 
stated that Lewis would remain 
in her apartment in Pioneer 
Hall, until the case could be 
settled in court, Bing said, 
adding that Lewis agreed to 
pay for the apartment if she lost 
the case. 

An administrative source dis­
agrees, saying Lewis received 
three notices stating she had to 
vacate the apartment. "She re­
ceived notice that as of July she 
should be out because she was 
no longer an employee. She 

then moved to an RA apart­
ment, but was informed by 
letter that she had to be out by 
Sept. 30. Although her attor­
ney went to court to prevent the 
college from moving her out of 
the apartment, they filed no pa­
per work and she was sent a 
letter stating that she needed to 
be out by 5 p.m. on Oct. 7." 

Bing said that Lewis be­
lieved there was an agreement 
preventing the college from re­
moving her from the apartment. 
She received a phone call at 
noon on Oct. 7 from Cafarelli 
informing her that she had to 
be out by 4 p.m. that afternoon. 
Bing said that Lewis then 
called the union and he and 
Hoerner came to the college. 

"At 4 o'clock the knock 
came and there were two cam­
pus police, six maintenance 
men, Joe Cafarelli, Dean Krell, 
Roland Watts and Raj Singh. 
We asked them if they had a 
court order and they said no. 
We then asked if they had any 
written documents and were 
told 'The bottom line is she's 
out," Bing said. 

Bing stated that he and Ho­
erner requested an additional 
45 minutes for Lewis to gather 
her personal belongings but 
Singh would only grant 15 
minutes. According to Bing a 
pass key was used to let the 
maintenance men into the 
apartment to remove Lewis' 
belongings. "We closed the 
door and they unlocked it." 
Lewis's belongings were 
moved to a room in the Towers 
according to Speert's memo. 

Speert's memo said that the 
room in the Towers was "com­
parable housing" Linda Dye, 
WPC AFT president, disagrees. 

"It is not comparable hous­
ing. There are no cooking fa­
cilities that she can use to cook 
for herself, and her possessions 
take up most of the room," Dye 
said. 

When asked about the situa­
tion Singh said. "I don't know 
if the Towers is comparable 
housing. I have never been 
there." 

"We are calling for the firing 
of Raj Singh because it was 
clearly his intent to intimidate 
Karen Lewis into dropping her 

suit." Bing asked "Why else 

would they remove her less 

then two weeks before this suit 

is scheduled to be settled?" 

to s 
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Appointments 
Anne Marie Schweer of Lin­

coln Park, NJ has been appoint­
ed coordinator of graduate 
studies at WPC. 

Schweer, who reports to the 
Assistant Vice President of 
Graduate Studies and Research, 
will be involved in carrying out 

policies and procedures of the 
Graduate Office. She will also 
manage applications, admis­
sions, enrollments, and office 
operations of the graduate of­
fice, and serve as the office's 
liaison to graduate faculty rep­
resentatives, the admissions of­

fice and the office of the regis­
trar. 

Before assuming her position 
at WPC, Schweer served as 
manager for enrollment and 
student services at the School 
of Nursing of the University of 
Medicine and Dentistry of New 
Jersey for three years. 

Schweer received a bache­
lor's degree in biology from 
Caldwell college and an MBA 
in management from Fairleigh 
Dickinson University. 

Zhiqiang Chen of Wayne has 
been appointed assistant pro­
fessor of mathematics at WPC. 

Chen received a bachelor of 
science degree in mathematics 
from Fudan University and a 
master's degree in mathematics 
from Shanghai Jiao Tong Uni­
versity. In May 1994 he earned 
his Ph.D. in mathematics from 
the University of Connecticut 

A specialist in statistics, 
Chen has had his research pub­
lished in the Journal of Mathe­
matical Analysis and Applica­
tion and the ACTA Mathemati-
ca Sinica. His work will also 
appear in an upcoming issue of 
the Annual Statistical Journal. 

*** 
Jolene Scully Gordon of 

Wayne has been appointed as­
sistant professor of psychology 

at WPC. 
Gordon received a bachelor's 

degree in elementary education 
from the University of Mis­
souri and a master's degree in 
educational psychology and re­
search from the University of 
Kansas. In addition she re­
ceived her master's degree in 
psychology and her Ph.D. in 
experimental psychology from 
Oklahoma State University. 

A specialist in neurocogni-
tive psychology, Gordon is cur­
rently focusing on research on 
investigating effects of context 
letter perception. The project 
is a continuation of her two-
year postdoctoral research 
which was done in collabora­
tion with James L. McClelland, 
Ph.D. at Carnegie Mellon Uni­
versity. 

Corrections 

This month 111 the Beacon History 

-In an October 10 interview 
with SGA President Lorraine 
Doumato, Ms. Doumato's 
name was inadvertently spelled 
wrong. 
-In the same article, the re­
porter responsible for the inter­
view, Brenda Sanabria, was in­
advertently left off. 
-In the October 10 article that 
accompanied the special 
Homecoming section, the float 
"God Loves You this Much" 
was incorrectly credited to 
Catholic Campus Ministries in­
stead of the Christian Fellow­

ship. 
-Due to a layout error, the ad­
dress of the WPC Women's 
center was cut from an article 
entitled "Lectures Highlight 
Rape Awareness." The Wom­
en's Center is located in the 
Student Center Room 214. 

-The credit line beneath the the 
picture accompanying an Octo­
ber 10 article entitled "19th 
Annual Press Day a Success," 
incorrectly identified Jeanne 
Nutter as Tina Lesher and vice-
versa. 



By Brenda Sanabria 
STAFF WRITER 

Have you ever wondered 
where the money from your 
Student Activity Fee goes? 
Have you ever asked who rep­
resents your concerns to the ad­
ministration? The answer is 
the Student Government Asso­
ciation. 

Located in the Student 
Center room 330, the SGA is 
open for business five days a 
week. Among other things, the 
SGA is the organization re­
sponsible for many of the cul­
tural and social activities host­
ed here on campus. While 
originally established to pro­
vide representation of student 
concerns, the SGA has evolved 
to provide guidance and sup­
port to the many clubs and stu­
dent organizations as well as 
supervising and supporting the 
class and school officers. 

The SGA consists of three 
separate bodies with the Legis­
lature being the largest. The 
Legislature is overseen by the 
Executive Board. The Execu­
tive Board is made up of Presi­
dent Lorraine Duomato, Execu­
tive Vice President Jennifer 
D'Amelio, Vice President Al-

COMEENJOY ONE OF THE LARGEST" 
SELECTIONS OF DRAFT BEERS 

o vest 29 DRAPT 
BEERS ON * 

fonso Pardo and Treasurer Ed­
ward Simpkins. The job of 

• overseeing and setting regula­
tions by which the SGA is run 
is handled by the Executive 
Board 
•*-. It is then the job of the var­
ious Legislature members to 
coordinate and supervise the 
activities of the standing com­
mittees of SGA. It is through 
these two organizations that 
student concerns are voiced. 

Doumato stated, "The two 
words that best sum up my in­
volvement in the SGA are 
stressful yet fun." 

As Executive Vice Presi­
dent, D'Amelio's job is to as­
sist the president in the general 
administration of association 
affairs and chairing club presi­
dents' meetings. 

All the club presidents re­
port to D'Amelio and she stat­
ed, "The touchy part of the job 
has been dealing with the club 
presidents. Four or five clubs 
have already been deactivated 
because they failed to report to 

, »» me. 
Simpkins responsibilities 

include planning the disburse­
ment of the student activity 
fees along with making semi­
annual reports to Legislature 

regarding the financial situation 
of all accounts. 

"Serving on Legislature 
has interfered a little with my 
social life but it's definitely 
gotten me more involved.; That 
energy carries over into my 
schoolwork," stated Simpkins. 

The remainder of SGA is 
composed of the, class officers, 
club interest representatives 
and school representatives. 

Sophomore class president 
and Board of Trustees Student 
rep. Alex Malino stated, "The 
best part is when we get togeth­
er and accomplish what we set 
out to do." As with other class 
presidents, Malino's jobs in­
clude presiding over class 
meetings and attending all of 
the meetings held by SGA's 
Executive Board. 

For those of you who 
would like to have an input as 
to how student fees are spent or 
what the SGA does, elections 
are held in bi-annually during 
October and April. For general 
membership, one only has to be 
a student who has paid the ac­
tivity fee. 

-Bobi Lee Messer contributed to 
this story. 
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SGA to vote 
on USNJ 

FROM USNJ PAGE 1 

Passaic County Community 
College join may be a struggle, 
and Montclair State may join 
two years from now. 

Delia Sosa told the Board 
that too much emphasis is 
placed on the number of actual 
colleges that have agreed to 
join USNJ. Instead, she feels 
that the focus should be placed 
on the fact that USNJ links var­
ious SGA's and forms a union, 
which allows WPC to have its 
voice and concerns heard in 
Trenton. 

"This money is vital to 
your (students') future," she 
said. 

Berger said the bottom line 
"is that USNJ is still fighting — 
we are just lobbying someone 
different." 

Berger declined ah inter­
view request by the Beacon, 
and directed questions toward 
Guerrieri. 

Guerrieri said she hopes 

students at WPC understand 
what USNJ does, and thinks 
that "students get sidetracked 
on what a large organization 
we are." 

She also said she hopes 
WPC students will continue to 
support the organization as 
they have for the past two 
years, and that to lose their 
membership would hurt USNJ. 

"The new commission is 
less attuned to students' needs 
than the previous Board, so we 
need to work harder," she said. 

According to Lorraine 
Doumato, SGA president, the 
SGA will take a vote on 
whether to join USNJ as soon 
as a Legislative Board member 
brings the matter to the Finance 
Committee. The Finance Com­
mittee hears funding requests. 
According to Pardo, no mem­
ber has showed any interest 
yet, and he can't predict how 
soon it will occur. 
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Is there a doctor in the house? 
By John F. Gillick 

EDITOR IN CHIEF 

The fact is, once in a while, we all get sick. 
Whether it be a head cold, walking pneumonia, or 
the Bubonic plague, you can relax and sleep well 
at night knowing one thing: it is an upper respira­
tory infection. To the nurses and the resident doc­
tor on campus, this is a blanket statement to be 
used to narrow down everything from the sniffles 
to full-blown gonnorhea. Don't worry folks, if 
you've just sneezed up a lung, amoxicillin will 
clear that right up for you. What did you say? 
You have a tumor on your neck the size of an 
ottoman? Relax, it's nothing that a little sudafed 
and a couple of cough drops won't take care of. 

Yes, I know I've taken to ranting, but there 
are some legitimate beefs hidden underneath my 
maniacal raving. Let's say your roommate has 
managed to devour a decent portion of your eye­
brow in a fight over that last beer in the fridge; 
fact still remains that it's now 10 minutes after 
noon and nurses can do nothing but cheer you on 
as you make a bloody run for Wayne General. 

Rumor has it that we have a resident doctor, 

who is more than willing to help us through these 
everyday traumas from 8 a.m. until noon. You 
might as well catch a ride from Sasquatch. I've 
tested this theory and I've never seen him in 
before 9:30, and come fl :45 he's playing the 
back nine. That leads me to my next beef. In the 
history of my life I have never seen a college stu­
dent up by 9 a.m. unless he was already seriously 
medicated (unless he had work; whatever). And 

take it from a fool who knows, when it's noon and 
you have a serious hangover, you want drugs, 
and we're talking big league pharmaceuticals, not 
a couple of aspirin and a half-baked smile from a 
nurse who's probably underpaid and would rather 
be doing anything other than smelling your beer 
breath. 

Granted, it is probably not their fault. The 
poor doctor is probably getting paid the same as if 
he were selling oranges on a street corner in East 
L.A., so who could blame him for not wasting his 
energy. But if someone were really sick, sorry, 
but that someone is in some really serious doo-
doo. And who could blame the nurses; would you 
want to be surrounded by sick people who do 
nothing but complain? (Yeah, didn't think so.) 

Bottom line: if the school is going to go so 
far as to provide students with health services, do 
it right. Don't waste the money, time, and effort 
by half-assing it. It does the students little good, 
and that undermines the whole idea. A little 
doesn't always go a long way, and I think most 
students would agree: do it or don't, but don't 
waste our money on appearances. 

LETTERS 
USNJ Director charges 
misrepresentation 
Editor, The Beacon: 

I am writing in response to an article printed 
in the September 19, 1994 issue of the Beacon in 
which I was severely misrepresented. 

According to the article, I claim that United 
Students of New Jersey, the state student associa­
tion, no longer lobbies on behalf of students. 
Nothing could be further from the truth. 
Unfortunately, this mischaracterization has led to 
much confusion; so please allow me to explain. 

USNJ has always lobbied and I, as an 
employee of the board of directors, am in no posi­
tion to change that mission, nor would I. The 
misunderstanding may have occurred when I 
explained to the reporter that lobbying does not 
merely mean meeting with officials in Trenton. It 
includes registering students to vote, helping stu­
dents organize letter-writing campaign and phone-

ins to their legislators, as well as educating stu­
dents about the issues that affect them. Under the 
law, and under USNJ's practice, such activities 
constitute lobbying. 

The reason I raised all of USNJ's activities 
was in response to the reporter's question, "Now 
that there is no Department of Higher Education, 
why do students need USNJ?" The position that 
the DHE and state Board of Higher Education 
were USNJ's main targets is simply incorrect, 
although it is currently being advanced by a few 
misinformed members of the WPC Student 
Governing Association. In any state government, 
the Legislature and the Governor make all of the 
budget decisions and legislative actions that affect 
students' lives while administrative bodies like 
the DHE and BHE merely created policy recom­
mendations and some funding guidelines. When 
WPC SGA members testified last year, they did 
so to a number of legislative committees. When 
Daniel Cimmino and Alex Malino of last year's 
SGA participated in a statewide press conference, 
they did so in front of the State House, not the 

DHE building. And when a busload of WPC stu­
dents rallied in Trenton, they were on the State 
House steps, not those of the DHE building. 

On behalf of the WPC SGA and student gov­
ernment at other community and state colleges 
and public universities, USNJ participated in the 
fight to keep the BHE and DHE. Those bodies 
have been replaced by a presidents' council and a 
commission on higher education. In case the 
point was not clear in the article, USNJ will treat 
them as we treated the DHE and BHE, as policy 
recommending bodies who need to hear from stu­
dents on regular basis. However, the legislature 
still holds most of the power in higher education 
and, unless the Board changes the mission of the 
organization, USNJ continue to hold legislators 
accountable to students on our issues. 

I regret the confusion this has caused and 
appreciate the opportunity to set the record 
straight. If anything has changed in the work that 
USNJ does, it is that our fight has become critical. 
Funding recommendations, especially for finan­
cial aid, are dangerously low and our schools have 
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LETTERS 
been told not to expect another penny from Governor 
Whitman. We have no option but to fight for the 
right of students to attend New Jersey's colleges and 
universities...DHE or no DHE! 

Sincerely, 

Staci Berger 
Executive Director 
[Ed. note: The Beacon, its editorial staff, and I stand 
behind Ms. Sanabria and her reporting on the article 
in question. Her notes were reviewed and the quotes 
are taken verbatim from Ms. Berger. Any misunder­
standings or misrepresentations caused by Ms. 
Berger, her stands, or her quotes are no fault of 
either The Beacon nor its staff. Jack Gillick, editor in 
chief] 

Attn: all WPC 
Frisbee Historians 
Editor, The Beacon: 

I am currently conducting research for a new 
book on the History and Birthplace of Frisbee play­
ing. (Ultimate Frisbee is being considered as a 
demonstration sport for the 1996 Olympic Games in 
Atlanta, GA.) 

I needed to rediscover early Frisbee games, arti­
facts, competitions, and published results. Did any 
Frisbee clubs or associations exist? Does anyone 
have an old newspaper clipping or photograph? I 
especially need samples of Frisbee Pie Pans with Pie 

Case, the Scalo flying disc, Wham-O Pluto Platters 
with packaging, and any early examples of flying 
disc-type objects. (I will reimburse expenses, etc.) 

I would like to invite anyone with early (PRE-
1965) Frisbee information to please contact me and 
become part of the process. I will inform everyone 
involved with this Frisbee research of my final con­
clusions. Thank you and Smooth Flights! 

Victor Malalfronte 
The Original World Frisbee Champion-1974 
P.O.Box 4020-002 
Alameda, CA 94501 
510-814-9639 

Beware of strangers 
bearing gifts ?! 
Editor, The Beacon, 

Did you ever apply for a credit card via one of the 
tables displayed in the Student Center or Wayne Hall? 
Well, if you didn't, I did, and it was a true learning 
experience. 

When I visited the college center for the first time, I 
observed various credit agencies trying to persuade 
students to fill out applications for credit cards. I 
was bothered occasionally by various representatives 
who were offering free gifts to those who just filled 
out the credit applications, but I never gave in. This 
is because I really did not need another bill to worry 
about every month — until one day, I finally gave in! 

I figured that I would create a credit history of 
George R. Meirose (preferably a favorable one). It is 

certainly not hard to find one of these agencies, espe-
cially if you hang around the game room much. 
Besides, they were giving away high quality blank 
cassette tapes for just applying (just what I need to 
copy my sister's Pearl Jam tape). So, I filled out the 
application and gave them a photocopy of my school 
identification and took my free gift. 

It was about a month later that I received a response 
from the company. I was really enthused until I 
opened the letter. The company wanted to give me a 
credit all right, but only if I invested $300 in one of 
their certificate of deposit (CD) accounts. I was com­
pletely infuriated by the audacity of this company to 
waste my time. Offering no annual fee and a free gift 
was a great incentive for me to apply, but trying to 
deceive me into investing $300 in a CD is a shameful 
act. Especially when CD interest rates earned just 
about the same as a savings account at that time. If I 
had to invest $300,1 would have called my broker. 

What the credit company tried to do was to tie up 
$300 of my money for collateral, as well as for 
investing in other securities to profit the company in 
the meantime. If I were to skip a payment for a 
month, while using their credit card with a $300 
limit, I would be charged with a high-interest pay­
ment. That's more money the company sucks out of 
my wallet. 

It is a disappointment that such companies are 
allowed to operate on campus, but I guess it is just a 
sign of the times. The next time you apply for a cred­
it card, be sure to venture beyond the free gifts and 
the waived annual fee and look for hidden costs and 
obligations you may have to endure. 

George R. Meirose 
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JOSE RODRIGUEZ, A FORMER WPC VARSITY FOOTBALL PLAYER, CHEER­
LEADER AND DECEMBER 1993 GRADUATE, WAS SERI­
OUSLY INJURED IN A CAR ACCIDENT ON AUGUST 8, 
1994. AFTER NEARLY TWO MONTHS OF HOSPITALIZA­
TION JOSE WAS FINALLY RELEASED FROM UNIVERSITY 
HOSPITAL IN NEWARK ON FRIDAY, SEPTEMBER 16, 
1994. DUE TO THE LENGTH OF HIS STAY AND THE 
SEVERITY OF HIS INJURIES HE HAS ACCUMULATED EXOR­
BITANT MEDICAL EXPENSES. 

WE, THE STUDENT BODY OF WPC, WOULD LIKE 
YOUR HELP IN OUR EFFORTS TO MAKE JOSE'S RECOV­
ERY AS QUICK AND EASY AS POSSIBLE. WE WOULD 

GREATLY APPECIATE ANY DONATION THAT YOU COULD MAKE ON JOSE'S BEHALF. 
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Red Hawk aerials pelt Pioneer defense 
FROM GOLDEN PAGE 16 

Evans collided on a handoff at 
the WPC eight-yard line, caus­
ing a fumble. Montclair defen­
sive lineman Chris Belcoure re­
covered the ball. 

Rolls caught a Cooney 
pass two downs later to give 
Montclair a 22-10 lead. 

WPC cut the gap to 22-17 
on its next possession when 
Dave Ryerson received a 27-
yard pass from Golden for a 
touchdown. 

But the Red Hawks added 
a touchdown with three min­
utes left in the third quarter on 
a Wells goal line run and ex­
tended their lead to 33-17 with 
a Rubinetti 30-yard field goal 
3:19 into the fourth quarter. 

The Pioneers, relying 
mostly on the running of Evans 
and Ryerson, led an 11-down 
drive which ended in Evans' 

one-yard TD and a Golden 
two-point conversion. 

The 33-25 score became 
final, however, as the Pioneers 
lost four yards in four straight 
downs and as Golden's pass on 
their final possession was inter­
cepted by sophomore safety 
Adam Lach with 45 seconds 
ieft c.n the clock. 

"We could have made up 
eight points in the fourth quar­
ter," said Pioneer Head Coach 
Gerry Gallagher. "We made 
some great plays, but not 
enough of them." 

The Pioneers travel to 
Worcester Polytechnical Insti­
tute Saturday at 1:30 p.m. 

CORRECTION 
In last week's football arti­

cle, Dave Ryerson was mis­
quoted due to a mistake in no­
tation. We regret the mistake. 

Itcail the Itencon. Eat at the Iteacan. Sing for the Itencon. 
Worship with the Itencon. Come to the Iteacon. Aieet the Iteacon. 
We gather on Aloiidnvs at 3:30 pm in Student Center Km 310. 
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HOW TO KEEP PEOPLE'S 
HANDS OFF YOUR MONEY. 

O Carry only enough cash to last the day. 
Anyone who tries to borrow your last five spot 
isn't a friend, anyway. 

ft Label your spare-change jar "beetle farm." 
Then, put your beetle farm in a jar labeled 
"spare change." 

ft Mark up every space on checks. 
Don't leave room for someone to fill in their 
name and extra zeros. 

ft Keep your wallet In your front pocket. 
It discourages pickpockets. So does wearing 
really tight pants. 

ft Put your picture on your credit card. 
A Citibank Photocard is tough for anyone else 
to use, unless they look just like you. 

< 
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WE'RE LOOKING OUT FOR YOU. 
To apply,  cal l  I -800-CITIBANK. 
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Grossman has high 
hopes for Pioneers 

By Jeremy Singer 
ASST SPORTS EDITOR 

According to WPC soccer 
star Adam Grossman, the key 
to the team's success in the fu­
ture is unity among the players. 

"This is a new mix of play­
ers, and we just came together 
this year. We're just starling to 
play together." said the sopho­
more forward, who transferred 
to WPC this year from Middle­
sex County College. "It's too 
bad the season is coming to an 
end. We stick together well." 

Grossman has done more 
for the Pioneers this year than 
compile a team-high five goals 
with three assists (through Fri­
day's action). He's become an 
emotional leader who has 
helped to keep his teammates' 
spirits up through this 4-9 sea­
son. 

"All through high school, I 
was a leader, and my team al­
ways won." he said. "I like to 
see everyone enjoying playing 
soccer. If it's a chore to play 
soccer, you're not going to play 
well." 

For Grossman, possibly 

the biggest difference between 
high school and college is team 
success. His Monroe High 
School team won the Greater 
Middlesex County Champi­
onship when he was a sopho­
more, and the worst season 
they had was 9-7, when he was 
a junior. 

But Grossman says that 
it's just a matter of time before 
the WPC team, which is made 
up mostly of freshmen and 
sophomores, starts winning 
games consistently. 

"Every day we go out and 
practice so we can become one 
of the best teams in the nation," 
he said. "With the players wc 
have here, we can become a na­
tional power." 

Rising to the top will be 
tough in the awesome New Jer­
sey Athletic Conference. So far 
this year, the Pioneers have lost 
tough decisions to conference 
rivals Kcan College, Trenton 
Stale College and Rowan Col­
lege, just to name a few, all of 
which arc nationally ranked. 

"It's a tough transition, but 
I do realize that it takes time," 

said Grossman. "I didn't expect 
all the competition to be as 
good as it is here, but I realize 
that we're young, and if we 
stick together, good things are 
going to happen." 

One thing (hat may help 
the future success of the team a 
field on campus which can be 
used exclusively for soccer, 
Grossman said. Both the men's 
and women's soccer teams cur­
rently share the decaying 
Wightman Field with the foot­
ball team. 

The soccer team has met 
with President Arnold Specrt to 
discuss the possibility of hav­
ing a soccer field built on cam­
pus. 

"Three different sports 
teams should not use the same 
field. Now that we have players 
to play with the best teams in 
the country, we need our own 
facility." said Grossman. 
"(Spcert) is very interested, and 
he would like to help. We'll 
meet with him again in a month 
and see what progress has been 
made." 

Wherever the WPC team 

winds up playing in the future, 
Grossman will feel at home if 
he is on a soccer field. He 
comes from a family that loves 
to play soccer, and he began 
playing when he was five. He 
made varsity as a freshman at 
Monroe High School, and soon 
achieved greatness there, mak­
ing All-State and being named 
team MVP his junior and se­

nior years. When he was a se­
nior, he lead the GMC with 24 
assists and was named to first 
team, All-Conference. 

Grossman is proud of his 
past accomplishments, but he 
would like to center on the pre­
sent, where he feels he has a 
job to do. 

"I'd like to help build a 
SEE GROSSMAN PAGE 13 

Adam Grossman (10) in high school action 
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Lecture 
Orthodox Islam on College Campuses 

As Salaam Alaikum 

Imam Wallace Deen Mohammed 
MUSLIM AMERICAN SPOKESMAN FOR HUMAN SALVATION 

WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 19,1994 
6:00 pin-Doors Open at 5:00 pm 

Shea Auditorium-William Paterson College 

Admission: FREE 

WPC Students/Staffs with I.D.--2 tickets per person, Non-WPC/Public—1 ticket per person 
Ticket Distribution will take place at the Student Center Information Desk on: October 12, 13,14 to WPC ONLY 

October 17,18,19 to WPC & Public 
Last day of tickets dstribution will be on: Wednesday, October 19, at 3:00 pm 

NO TICKETS WILL BE GIVEN AT DOOR 
SPONSORS: BLACK STUDENTS ASSOCIATION, BROTHERS FOR AWARENESS, MUSLIM SOCIETY, SAPB 

SGA FUNDED 



Defense keeps 
FROM SOCCER Pific ic 
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FROM SOCCER PAGE 16 

play of their defense. 
"Our defense is very un­

derrated; without them we 
wouldn't be doing as well as 
we are," she said. "For a good 
offense, you first need good de­
fense to back you up." 

Victim number two was 
FDU-Madison on Tuesday 
night, again at Wightman Field. 

Sharkey opened the scor­
ing seven minutes into the 
match, scoring on a shot assist­

ed by Tara Cunningham to the 
upper-right post. Sharkey 
wasted no time scoring her sec­
ond goal of the game just one 
minute later to give the Pio­
neers a 2-0 lead. 

Midfielder Linda Axtell 
scored her sixth goal of the 
year with five minutes left in 
the first half to give WPC a 3-
0 lead halftime advantage. 

Halftime did not weaken 
the La.iy Pioneers' offensive 
attack; they combined for six 

more goals in the second half. 
In a span of six minutes, WPC 

"The girls came 
together and 
jelled very 
well." -Woods 
scored three goals. The first 
came from Sharkey, who 

scored her third goal of the 
game with 38 minutes left in 
the half. 

Marz then scored at the 
36-minute mark, assisted by 
Michele Huizing, to give the 
Pioneers a 5-0 lead. Axtell net­
ted her second goal of the game 
two minutes later to give WPC 
a 6-0 lead. 

FDU managed to muster 
up a little offense in the second 
half, but were no match for the 
Pioneer defense led by Amer-

Accepted at 
more Schools 
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man, Kristin Zack, and Howe. 
Marz then scored her sec­

ond goal of the game at the 26-
minute mark to make her total 
nine goals on the season and to 
put the game out of reach for 
FDU. Sharkey booted in her 
fourth goal of the game and 
Zack finished out WPC's scor­
ing binge with her first goal ol 
the season. 

Head Coach Brian Woods 
is happy to see that this team is 
playing better than expected at 
the beginning of the season. 

"The girls came together 
and jelled very well," Woods 
said. "You don't usually see 
that until mid-season; our girls 
came together in the first cou­
ple of weeks." 

The true test for the Lady 
Pioneers comes Monday night, 
October 17, at Wightman Field 
against NJAC rival Richard 
Stockton College. A win 
would give the Lady Pioneers 
sole possession of second place 
in the New Jersey Athletic 
Conference. 

Player 
looks 
ahead 

FROM GROSSMAN PAGE 12 

winning program here," he 
said. "I want to finish at .500 
this year and make the NCAA 
tournament this year." 

Grossman seems some­
what undecided about his fu­
ture. He doesn't have a major, 
but he's thinking about going 
into law enforcement and pos­
sibly following in the footsteps 
of his father, who is a retired 
police officer. 

"Maybe I'll go into the Se­
cret Service or something," 
said Adam. "I don't want to sit 
behind a desk. I want to do 
something exciting." 

Right now, Grossman is 
one of the most exciting young 
players in the NJAC. And if 
things go the way he says they 
will, the entire team will be not 
only exciting, but also feared 
by opponents in the not-too-
distant future. 

"In time, we're going to 
turn some heads," he said. 
"Teams are starting to give us 
respect, but I don't like to wor­
ry about what other teams think 
of us because what we do on 
the field is what counts. 

"It doesn't feel good to 
lose, but I swallow it because I 
know that next year, things will 
be different." 
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Field hockey on a roller coaster 
By Tom Stevens 

SPORTS CONTRIBUTOR 

This week was an emo­
tional roller coaster ride for the 
WPC field hockey team. The 
girls went 1-2, losing to Tren­
ton State College last Saturday, 
coming back with a victory 
over Rowan College on Tues­
day, then losing to Muhlenberg 
College on Thursday. 

The Pioneers lost 9-1 in 
Trenton on October 8. Coach 
Valerie Fannelle feels that it 
had a lot to do with the turf. 

"It turns into a different 
game on turf," she said. "It's a 
lot faster and the ball is hit a lot 
harder at you. It's a big adjust­
ment for a team (WPC) that 
usually plays on grass. We 
were really effected by how 
fast the pace was." 

The Pioneers knew going 
into the Trenton game that they 
would have a difficult time 
playing them. Not only was 
the playing surface a factor, but 
so was the memory of the 7-0 

loss to Trenton at home on 
Sept. 21. 

"Our goal going into this 
game was to score against 
Trenton on turf," said Fannelle. 

WPC accomplished that 
goal as Colleen Schlereth 
nailed one home, dealing Tren­
ton its first goal allowed in 
league play, and only the third 
against them all season. 

"Even though it was a bad 
loss for us, we came off the 
field knowing we had scored 
against them, and that was big 
for us." 

After falling to 5-7 on the 
season, the Pioneers came back 
on October 11 and played 
strongly in a 2-1 overtime win 
over Rowan. 

"This was a big plus," Fan­
nelle said. "I think it was prob­
ably our biggest win of the sea­
son and it felt really good to 
beat someone ranked in the top 
ten of our division." 

Rowan was listed at num­
ber nine in the country at that 
time. 

Tracy Smith netted both 
goals for the Pioneers. Her 
second one, which decided the 
outcome of the contest, came 
five minutes into overtime. 

"The ball was hit to (de-
fenseman) Alicia Shutz," Fan­
nelle said, describing the win­
ning play. "Alicia took the 
shot and it hit the post and Tra­
cy got the rebound and put it 
in. 

H.S. x-country run 
debuts on campus 

By Jeremy Singer 
ASST. SPORTS EDITOR 

When Ralph LaMonica 
took over as WPC track and 
cross-country coach this past 
fall, there wasn't much of a 
track-and-field team at all. 

Not only were both the 
men's and women's cross­
country teams short of runners, 
they didn't even have uniforms. 
The school's field program had 
been all but terminated, and the 
track recruiting program was 
almost nonexistent. 

"My goal this year was to 
get us organized," said LaMon­
ica. "Any improvement from 
here comes from recruiting. We 
have to start from scratch." 

So LaMonica organized a 
long-distance running meet of 
high school athletes, held Sat­
urday at WPC. Track teams 
from John F. Kennedy High 
School in Paterson, Shore Re­
gional High School in Ocean 
County, DePaul High School in 
Wayne, Parsipany High School 
and Cedar Grove High School 
sent runners to the meet, which 
LaMonica plans to hold again 
next year. 

"The schools that did com­
pete assured me not only that 

they would return, but that they 
would talk to other coaches 
about coming next year." 

LaMonica gave out WPC 
brochures and refreshments to 
the high school athletes before 
the meet. He also gave out vari­
ous awards, including every­
thing from plaques to WPC t-
shirts, to the meet's top per­
formers. All participants re­
ceived medals. 

LaMonica said many stu­
dent runners expressed interest 
in the WPC track program after 
the meet, including one girl 
who apparently told LaMonica 
that she would like to attend 
WPC. 

"In our conference, there 
are two very good programs: 
Rowan and Trenton State," said 
LaMonica. "When I came here, 
there were two girls returning 
from last year's team, and that 
was it. We have to get distance 
runners into this school." 

LaMonica hired movement 
science professor Serge Von 
Duvillard, a former track-and-
field coach at the University of 
California, Los Angeles 
(UCLA) and the University of 
Southern California (USC) as 
well as a former runner for the 
German National Team, as an 

assistant coach to help get the 
school's field program back off 
the ground. 

"Now, we can say we have 
the finest field coach in the 
area," said LaMonica. "I've 
talked to some other coaches 
who want to know if they can 
send some of their players over 
once a week just to listen to 
him." 

Having great teachers like 
Von Duvillard and Janet Pagan, 
the staff s other assistant, will 
give the track-and-field pro­
gram a much-needed boost. 

The Pioneers will also be 
helped if the school's decaying 
track is replaced. 

"Most high schools have 
better track facilities than us," 
said LaMonica. "If we can get 
the field to the level it has to be 
at, we can be very competi­
tive." 

The track-and-field and 
cross-country teams are cur­
rently recruiting athletes, main­
ly women to fill out the under­
filled women's roster. Interest­
ed WPC students can call LaM­
onica at home at 785-8516 or 
in his office at 595-2750. 

"This was the game that 
we played the best as a team. 
As a whole, we finally put it all 
together and gave it 110 per­
cent," she said. 

The Lady Pioneers were 
beaten 5-1 in the first meeting 
on September 24 in Rowan, 
which makes last Tuesday's 
victory sweeter for the team 
and the coaches. 

After inching ever so clos­
er to .500, the Lady Pioneers 
suffered a 4-1 defeat to Muh­
lenberg on October 13 at home 
to fall to 6-8. 

Dawn Willever scored the 
only goal for the Pioneers 9:45 
into the first half. The score 
stood at 1 -0 at halftime. But in 
the second half, after Muhlen-
burg tied the score, the game 
became a struggle for WPC. 

"We started getting a little 
frustrated," said Fannelle. 
"The communication broke 
down and we weren't passing 
well. I guess we started getting 
frustrated after they scored and 
we couldn't get back into it. 
We were just very emotional. 
We played well throughout the 

whole first half, but in the sec­
ond half we got a little down 
and we couldn't pick ourselves 
back up." 

WPC may not afford to 
lose another game this year if 
they want to make the playoffs. 

"We can still finish 10-8," 
said Fanne'L. "We should still 
have a chance in some post­
season play." 

The last four games of the 
regular season are at Kean Col­
lege, scheduled to be played 
this past Saturday, home 
against Montclair State College 
Wednesday, home against 
Delaware Valley on Oct. 22, 
and away at Manhattanville on 
Oct. 26. Kean and Montclair 
are NJAC match-ups for WPC. 

"We'd really like to finish 
.500 in the conference," said 
Fannelle, "but all four games 
are important ones that we need 
to win." 

The Lady Pioneers are cur­
rently 2-4 in the NJAC. 

"We'll do very well if the 
intensity level is up, and if we 
play together as a team I think 
we should do fine." 



Classifieds 
SPRING BREAK '95--Ameri-
ca's #1 Spring Break Compa­
ny! Cancun, Bahamas, Daytona 
& Panama! 110% Lowest Price 
Guarantee! Organize 15 friends 
and TRAVEL FREE! Earn 
highest commissions! 1-800-
32-TRAVEL 
Seeking—intermediate Rac-
quetball partner. Tuesdays, 
Wednesdays, Thursdays. Call 
595-2643 or 789-5966 
ChildCare—Responsible, en­
thusiastic, creative person, to 
care for 3&6 yr. old children, 
in my Wayne home. Trans­
portation required. 956-7746' 
Spring Break 95—SELL 
TRIPS, EARN CASH & GO 
FREE!!! Student Travel Ser­
vices is now hiring campus rep­
resentatives. Lowest rates to 
Jamaica, Cancun, Daytona, and 
Panama City Beach. Call 1-
800-648-4849. 
NCE, GRE, SAT tutoring ex­
perience certified teacher pis. 
call 447-4839. 

Personals 
Sue—You are the best room­
mate one could have in the life 
time. Thanks. Love, Jamie. 
Mystical Eight-Hang in there. 
We'll get out of here alive. 
Love, Jamie. 
Drew--I love you and thank 
you for being there for me. 
Good luck with your BARD!!! 
Just don't kill any German 
pawnshop guys. Love, Toky 
To the brothers of BPE-had a 
great time doing floatbuilding 
with you! Love, the Angels 
BZP Cheryl—Great job with 
all your work on the float! 
Love, the Angels 
Lisa(ASA Associate)—Con­
grats! Keep up your attitude of 
excellence! 1 know you can do 
it! Love, Stacey (ASA) 
Dana(ASA Associate)—Con­
grats on your bid and presiden­
cy! Always remember I am 
here for you! Love in ASA, 

Need Money? Want to 
work?—Telemarketers & Su­
pervisors good day. make your 
own hours. Call Mr.Welsh791-
6752 
Babysitter—wanted for some 
days & Sat. nights. Pis call 
696-5446. 
Wanted-lndividuals and Stu­
dent Organization of Promote 
SPRING BREAK'95. Earn 
substantial MONEY and FREE 
TRIPS. CALL INTER-CAM-
PUS PROGRAMS. 1-800-327-
6013 
Alaska Employment—Fishing 
Industry. Earn to $3,00-
6,000+per month =benefits. 
Male/Female. No experience 
necessary. 206-545-4155 
ext.A51061 
SPRING BREAK-Nassau, 
Paradise Island, Cancun and Ja­
maica from $299. Air, Hotel, 
Transfers, Parties and More! 
Organize small group-earn 
FREE trip plus commissions! 
Call 1-800-822-0321 

Christine 
Amy V(ASA)—You are a great 
roommate & a terrific friend, 
thanks for putting up with me! 
Love Pratti(ASA) 
ASA sisters—Thank you for all 
your love & support! I knew I 
could count on you. Love, 
Pratti(ASA) 
Colleen(ASA Associate)— 
Congradulations on your bid! 
Good Luck! I know you can do 
it! I love you!Love, Missy 
(ASA) 
ANNE—You arc the only one 
for me. You are my one and 
only. I am yours for the taking. 
You make a difference in my 
life. God has blessed me the 
day I met you. 
HAPPY ONE YEAR AN-
NIVERSARY!!!—Here's to 
another one. I love you a lot. 
Mahal Kita. Wo Hay Ni. Yo te 
amo mucho. 

SPRING BREAK '95-Earn 
FREE trips, Cash and year 
round Travel Discounts 
through the East coasts. Leader 
of Ski and Spring Break Desti­
nations. Call Epicurean Tours 
today! 1-800-231-4-FUN. 
Fund raising-Choose from 3 
different fundraisers lasting ei­
ther 3 or 7 days.No Investment. 
Earn $$$ for your group plus 
personal cash bonuses for your-
self.Call 1-800-932-
0528,ext.65. 
Childcare—After-school hour 
position avalible. $ 7-8 per hr. 
Experience,references, car nec­
essary. A choice nanny. 891-
2273 
Nissan Sentra SE for Sale— 
22,000mls. Good condition, 5 
speed manual, AM/FM cas­
sette. $1500 or B/O. Call 904-
1217 
Babysitter—Friday AM. Refer­
ence required. Call 694-0651 
For rent—3 BR apt. 10 min 
from campus. Reasonable rent 

Christie(AST Associate)—I 
am so happy to be your big. Be 
strong and make me proud! I 
know you will! Love your big 
sister, Kristine(AST) 
Mara(AST Associate)—I'm 
honored that you picked me to 

also furnished rooms to rent 
with kitchen and bath 942-
1452. 
Spring Break 95—Travel free, 
earn $$$. Discount just for ap­
plying. 1-900-828-4688 
DJ DJ DJ DJ DJ DJ DJ — 
Violet sounds, DJ services, 
Great music, lights, four hours 
$250, call Mark 201-447-3555 
Private schools seeks exp. 
trainer w/strong Mac/PC bkgd. 
to conduct computer classes. 
Fax or mail resume: Design On 
Disk, 400 River Road, New 
Milford, NJ 07646- FAX: 261-
2503. 
Travel Free-CANCUN, NAS­
SAU, JAMAICA, & SOUTH 
PADRE ISLAND. Spring 
break with Sun Bound Vaca­
tions. Organize a small group 
of 15 as a college rep. Call 1-
800-4-SUN-BOUND for de­
tails. 
Speech Language Specialist-
Excellent opportunity for col­
lege graduates enrolled in a 

work. I know you'll make me 
proud. Love your big, 
Mandy(AST) 
Vanessa(AST Associate)—I'm 
very happy to be your big sis­
ter. Be strong, I know you can 
do it! Love your big, Jen-

masters programs for Speech 
Language Specialists to obtain 
paid experience. $21.78 per 
hour. EOE/AA. Please send re­
sume to: Dr. June Zabchin, 
Bergen County Special Ser­
vices, 327 E.Ridgewood Ave., 
Paramus, NJ 07652 
Help Wanted- -Waiters&wait-
ress. Well train good starting 
pay flexible hours. Call Tides 
Restaurant, N.Haledon NJ for 
interview. 423-2282 
Cruise Ships Hiring-Earn up 
to $2,000+/ mo. on Cruise 
Ships or Land-Tour companies. 
Seasonal & full time employ­
ment available. No exp. neces­
sary. For info, call 1-206-634-
0468 ext.C51061 
SPRING BRAKE'95-Sell 
trips. Earn Cash& Go Free!!! 
Student Travel Services is now 
hiring campus representatives. 
Lowest rates to Jamaica, Can­
cun, Daytona and Panama City 
Beach. Call 1-800-648-4849. 

To my little Sally—Welcome 
to our family. Hold your head 
up high and keep smiling.Love 
your big, Nicole(DPhiE) 
To my little Kristine—Keep up 
the good work. I'm behind you 
100%. Love ya! Love your 

be your big. Keep up the good nifer(AST) 

Excellent 
Part Time Job 
Earn Holiday cash and gain valuable 

business experience. 
Work in our convienet Riverdale Location using 

our state of the art equipment. 
(minutes from Route 287) 

We seek outgoing, confident, individuals wishing 
to earn over $7.00 per hour. 

We offer a professional yet upbeat work environ­
ment 

Call for an immediate interview appointment 

201-835-8112 

the £< big, Trisha(DPhiE) 

FRESHMAN I SOPHOMORES 
WHAT, ARE YOU DOING NEXT SUMMER ? 

Hit the beach 
FIND OUT ABOUT THE PLATOON LEADERS CLASS. AN ALTERNATIVE 
TO ROTC. YOU'LL INTERN WITH THE MARINES FOR SIX WEEKS NEXT 

SUMMER AND EARN $1650. YOU'LL GET IN GREAT SHAPE, EARN 3 
COLLEGE CREDITS AND LEARN WHAT BEING A MARINE OFFICER IS 

ALL ABOUT. ITS A GREAT WAY TO EXPERIENCE THE MILITARY 
WITHOUT INCURRING ANY OBLIGATION. FOR MORE INFORMATION 

CALL CAPTAIN PITINGOLO OR GUNNERY SERGEANT DAVIS AT 

1-800-627-8762 

ASK ABOUT OUR AVIATION PROGRAMS! 

Marines 



Foo tba l l  Socce r  Vo l l e yba l l  Swimmi ng  Baske tba l l  Baseb a l l  D iv ing  So f t ba l l  He ld  Hockey  

Ground attack fails to save WPC 
By Walter Elliott 

SPORTS EDITOR 

The WPC football team 
lost a battle of rushing versus 
passing, 33-25 to Montclair 
State University Saturday night 
at Montclair. 

The Pioneers ran for 309 
yards, led by quarterback Jamie 
Golden and fullback Andre 
Evans, who rushed for 105 
yards apiece. Montclair was 
held to just 143 yards on the 
ground. 

The Red Hawks largely 
prevailed, however, by taking 
to the air. Freshman quarter­
back Brian Cooney threw three 
touchdown passes in the first 
half and passed for 241 yards 
in the game. 

Golden, by comparison, 
passed for just 103 yards. That, 

combined with five WPC 
turnovers, three of which 
Montclair converted into 
scores, brought the Pioneers to 
a 1-5 (1-2 NJAC) season 
record. 

Montclair took control of 
its Homecoming game on the 
opening possession on Scott 
Rubinetti's 33-yard field goal. 

WPC tied the game 9:33 
into the second quarter on 
Mark Hazen's 24-yard field 
goal five plays after taking ad­
vantage of a bad Montclair 
punt return. 

The Red Hawks fired back 
three plays later on a Tyrone 
Rolls 70-yard TD sprint off a 
short pass from Cooney. 

Pioneer defensive tackle 
Len Zdanowicz stripped the 
ball from Montclair runner A.J. 
Wells late in the half and re­

turned it 13 yards for a touch­
down to tie the score at 10. 

Montclair's Cooney re­
sponded with a five-play, 42-
second aerial act that ended' 

with a 31-yard connection to 
Tremaine Wimberly to put the 
Red Hawks ahead 16-10 by the 
half. 

The fast pace continued 

into the second half, but at the 
Pioneers' expense. 

On the first play of the 
third quarter, Golden and 
SEE GOLDEN PAGE 10 

Shelby Howe notched her 
fourth shutout of the year, play­
ing a stubborn game in goal by 
deflecting 25 shots. 

Midfielder Tara Cunning­
ham credits the team's success 
to their hard work. 

"We are winning because 
we are playing with our hearts, 
all our hard work and determi­
nation comes from the heart; 
we all give 100 percent," she 
said. 

Co-Captain Marz feels that 
most of the Lady Pioneers' suc­
cess this season is due to the 
SEE SOCCER PAGE 13 

Marz to give the Lady Pioneers 
a halftime lead. 

That was all the Lady Pio­
neers needed as Linda Axtell 
scored on a pass from Eileen 
Sharkey just six minutes gone 
in the second half. Marz got 
back into the action just seven 
minutes later, scoring her sev­
enth goal of the year to put the 
pioneers up 3-0 with 32 min­
utes left to play the game. 

Amy Lasher sealed the 
victory for the Lady Pioneers 
by scoring her first goal of the 
season with 17:23 left in the 
game. 

By JoAnne Mabes 
SPORTS CONTRIBUTOR 

After the WPC womens 
soccer team's dramatic double-
overtime loss 1-0 to NJAC ri­
val Ramapo College last Satur­
day, the Lady Pioneers won 
consecutive shutouts this past 
week at Wightman field. 

The first team to fall vic­
tim to WPC was Manhat-
tanville College. The teams 
played a scoreless tie until 
17:09 remaining in the first half 
when Rebecca Amerman 
scored on a pass from Maureen H - , V% ' -iis "> '. 

Midfielder Helen Cheng (5) on the attack in a recent night game. 

3. Fmmtt Sparts WsMy Fmmmr 
Crosscountry Field Hockey Football Men's Soccer Women's Soccer Volleyball 

Bold=Home 

STOCKTON 
ST., 7p.m. 

Ramapo, 
7 p.m. ROWAN 

4 p.m. 

Thurs MUHLNB'G, 
4 p.m. 

Mount St. Mary, 
7 p.m. 

CS1, Lehman; 
6 p.m. 

Worcest'r Poly. 
1:30 p.m. 

Gothic Invitn'l, 
9 a.m. 

Centnry, Old 
Westbry 1 p.m. 

Lady Pioneers have shutout week 
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Hvp JeSUS&MaryChain 
at the Garden STOMP 



MORE ALTERNATIVE 
By Paul Fucito 
INSIDER CONTRIBUTOR 

Jesus & Mary Chain 
Stoned And Dethroned 

(American) 

Since 1985, brothers William and Jim 
Reid have created an international following 
centered around their distorted electric gui­
tars and driving rhythms. With the release of 
their new album Stoned & Dethroned, they 
have turned down their amplifiers to create a 
60's style folk-pop sound. This new, semi-
acoustic sound is a radical direction change 
following the success of their last album 
Honey's Dead, which was the highlight of 
their trademark sound. 

Even though the Reids have taken a 
new musical direction, loyal fans can rest 
knowing that the new album is still pure Je­
sus & Mary Chain in every respect. The 
brothers have focused on bringing out the 
melodies and vocals, which could barely be 
heard above the guitars on previous albums. 
Just think of this album as a semi-unplugged 
Honey's Dead, with lyrics you can actually 
hear. 

Stoned & Dethroned contains 17 brief, 
yet beautifully satisfying, songs. The current 
single, "Sometimes Always," is a duet featur­
ing Hope Sandoval, lead singer of Mazzy 
Star. There are plenty of other great songs 
to choose from including: "Girlfriend," "She," 
"You've Been a Friend," and "Feeling Lucky." 
The song "Come On" is featured on the 

soundtrack for the upcoming film Love & a 
.45. In addition, a non-album track, 
"Snakedriver" can be found on the sound­
track to The Crow. 

Listening to the new Jesus & Mary 
Chain andl admit to being slightly dethroned 
when I heard the new single, since I had 
nearly worn out my copy of the their last al­
bum. However, it didn't take long for me to 
accept the new album with a very satisfying 
grin. 

Stoned & Dethroned is another step in 
the right direction for the Reid brothers. 
Their musical and lyrical talents, traditionally 
overshadowed by the buzzing distortion of 
electric guitars, finally have a chance to shine 
through. This album is a worthy addition to 
any record collection, alternative or not. 

ASCAP Awards 
By Pam Ritter 
INSIDER CONTRIBUTOR 

WPC professors Donald Fornuto, 
Reynold Weidenaar, and Hugh Aitken, have 
been named 1994-95 award recipients by the 
American Society of Composers, Authors, 
and Publishers (ASCAP). 

The ASCAP award, intended to support 
and promote writers of serious work, is given 
once a year. Decisions are based upon the 
sole value of each writer's catalog of original 
music compositions in addition to recent per­
formances of those pieces. 

Fornuto, professor emeritus of music 
and ASCAP award recipient for 12 years, has 
composed a number of choral and instru­
mental works and has accompanied many 
renowned vocalists in performances of his 
compositions. Fornuto's "Adirondack Land­
scapes," written for piano, clarinet, percus­
sion, and electronic tape, has been per­
formed not oniy at WPC, but also at New 
York University, Fairleigh Dickinson Universi­
ty, and Rowan College. 

"I'm pleased that ASCAP, which gener­
ally gives its support to popular music, gives 
to classical as well," exclaims Fornuto. 

Fornuto is an active member of the Mu­
sic Educators National Conference, the Na­
tional Association of Jazz Educators, and the 
Composers Guild of New Jersey. 

Reynold Weidenaar, professor of the 
communication department, is a specialist in 
video and electronic music, combining pro­
jected video with music on tape and live ac­
companiment. Weidenaar has received the 
ASCAP award since 1980 and states, "Ifs a 
very nice honor." 

Weidenaar's first concert video, "Love of 
Line, of Light and Shadow: The Brooklyn 
Bridge," was a grand prize winner at the 
Tokyo Video Festival in 1983. "The Brooklyn 
Bridge" includes clarinet accompaniment, 
color video, and electronic sound. 

In addition to "The Brooklyn Bridge," 
Weidenaar has produced four concert videos 
which have received more than 2000 screen­
ings and broadcasts and have been per­
formed live over 300 times. His videos have 
received the Director's Choice Award, top 
prizes in the National Video Competition, and 
a CINE Golden eagle. 

Hugh Aitken, music professor, has been 
recognized by ASCAP for his compositions in 
the past, which include two operas and an or­
atorio. Aitken's "Thirteen Ways of Looking at 
a Blackbird," written for baritone and three 
percussionists, was performed recently at 
WPC. His "One Music as Before," for chorus 
and organ, was awarded first prize in an in­
ternational composition hosted by the Flori-
lege Vocal de Tours in France. 

Aitken, an ASCAP award recipient since 
1965, has composed two pieces, "Cantata 
#40" and Double Trouble," which wili be fea­
tured at WPC this fall. 

"I'm very grateful for this support, be­
cause classical music does not receive the 
royalties that popular music does," said For­
nuto. 

"Very often, a composer's music may be 
very good," said Reynold Weidenaar. "How­
ever, it doesn't receive the recognition it de­
serves. The ASCAP award is meant to ac­
knowledge the value of a serious composer's 
music. It is nice to be recognized by ASCAP." 

LIVE CLHPTOn 
Meryle Mahrer Kaplan 

INSIDER CONTRIBUTOR 

'This is really, really, really me. This is 
my musical identity today, where I've come 
from and what I mean. Wherever I go in the 
future will be as a result of this." 

The words come from Eric Clapton, in 
an interview about his new album, From the 
Cradle, broadcast on WNEW FM on Septem­
ber 11, 1994. 

When Eric Clapton walked on stage 
Monday night for the last of three New York 
City shows in his "Nothing but the Blues" 
tour, he said this "is something I have always 
wanted to do." 

Clapton then proceeded to do just that 
for two hours of wonderful non-stop music. 
He didn't spend a lot of time speaking about 
his feelings about the music and the people 
who had created it. However, his genuine 
respect for the music was clear in the way 
that he played, credited each song, and paid 
tribute to the musicians by having their pic­
tures projected on the screens flanking the 
stage. 

The radio interview quoted above and 
the concert program provide a sense of the 
depth of Eric Clapton's feeling for the blues. 

The album was no frivolous change of 
pace for Clapton but something deeply per­
sonal and risky to share his long term, rock-
oriented audience. Clapton describes the 
blues as the "most important music in my 
life." In remembering the first time he heard 
Muddy Waters, Clapton says the music "did 
something to me emotionally and much 
deeper that I cannot define." Clapton said 
that when he hears Muddy Waters, "it moves 
me to the core today, exactly like when I was 
a small boy." 

When Clapton makes brief reference of 
the "sound of suffering" to risk and drama, it 
is hard for his fans not to fill in some of the 
blanks because we are privy to his personal 
life. However, Clapton's own emphasis fo­
cuses on the experience of the music itself. 
From his place as a famous white, British 
rock musician, Clapton wants us to know the 
enduring importance of the blues in his life 
and in his music. The album and the tour are 
a "tribute, a way to pay back, emulate, and 
thank" the musicians he feels he has heard 
"from the cradle to the grave." 

For those of us who have followed Clap­
ton's career -- whether newly discovering 
Derek and the Dominoes, Cream, Blind 
Faith, along with Clapton's more recent work 
- or for those of us who have grown up with 
Clapton(l put myself in this category -- shar­
ing in the spanning of adulthoods over the 
three decades of Clapton's career), any new 
work by this accomplished musician is wel­
comed. 

For those of us that love the blues and 
find particular meaning in this music, it is 
wonderful to have the opportunity to hear that 
Clapton shares this love. His tribute to 
Robert Johnson, ,viuddy Waters, Howlin" 
Wolf, Elmore James, Ray Charles, Jimmie 
Rogers, Bessie smith, Freddie King, and oth-

.ers provides us with a truly significant mo­
ment. 

To see him playing this tribute live was 
extraordinary. In describing his current work, 
Clapton talked about how he sought to "repli­
cate" the music and how "it still sounds like 
me doing it." 

The beauty of the performance comes 
from Clapton's ability to pay tribute and re­
spect at the same time, particularly through 

his longer and longer guitar solos, he makes 
it sound like him. 

Typically accompanied by two back-up 
guitars and by some combination of piano, 
drum, harmonica, two saxophones, and a 
trumpet, Clapton played about 20 songs. 

The concert began with an acoustic gui­
tar rendition of Johnson's "Malted Milk," fol­
lowed by LeRoy Carr's "How Long Blues," 
where Clapton was accompanied by back-up 
guitars, washboard, and Chris Stainton's 
wonderful piano. Clapton quickly turned to 
electric guitars for the bulk of the show. For 
me, "Hoochie-Coochie Man," the Willie Dixon 
song recorded by Muddy Waters was one of 
the high points of the show with a rendition 
that far exceeded the performance on the al­

bum. 
During the second hour of the show, the 

crowd rose to its feet, song after song as 
Clapton did what he does best - absolutely 
incredible guitar work. The sound, the in­
credible accomplishment of treating each 
song as an opportunity for full, intense ex­
pression is not something I can put into 
words. 

But the last third of the concert became 
more and more amazing as Clapton moved 
through songs including "Blues Before Sun­
rise," (the Leroy Carr song recorded by El­
more James), "Third Degree," (the Eddie 
Boyd/Willie Dixon Song), "Sinner's Prayer," 
(written by Lowell Glenn and Lowell Fulsom), 
"Motherless Child," "Five Long Years," and 
Robert Johnson's "Crossroads." 

Dan Akroyd and Jimmie Vaughan joined 
Clapton on stage for the encore number. 
Akroyd's harmonica solo and his joyous 
dancing and singing were a fantastic addition 
to the concert and a joy to watch. Akroyd's 
introduction however, added to my sense of 
how wonderful it would have been to have 
others join in on stage. Although we-unfortu-
nately missed almost all of Jimmie Vaugh-
an's 30 minute opening act, his band was 
much more diverse and it was a pleasure to 
see and hear the group on stage. 

As much as I wanted the group to be ex­
panded, I also wanted to hear Clapton, un­
plugged and solo, playing the blues. The day 
after the concert, I listened to Robert John­
son's recording. The difference here is clear. 
Johnson, who died in the 1930s at age 26 
plays alone: one man and one guitar making 
the blues. To my ear, Johnson's singing and 
his guitar playing complement each other 
perfectly. The combination is haunting and 
deeply personal. In the boxed set notes, 
Clapton describes Johnson's music as the 
"most powerful cry that I think you can find in 
the human voice." Eric Clapton's guitar play­
ing is phenomenal and approaches this point. 
His singing is good but cannot consistently 
reach the level of intensity of the music—how 
could it? 

For me, the intimate connection of Clap­
ton and music comes from the combination 
of the interview material and Clapton's histo­
ry, combined with the very wonderful concert 
performance. While a step more exposed 
and more risky, I would have loved to hear 
Clapton sing by himself. Interestingly, the 
point in the concert that came closest was 
when Clapton was accompanied only by a pi­
ano and without his guitar and belted out 
Bessie Smith's "Ain't Nobody's Business But 
My Own." Clapton's blues are his "business." 
We are lucky that Clapton has shared what 
he has of this passion. I feel very fortunate 
to have heard Eric Clapton's "Nothing but the 
Blues" live and look forward to what this in­
credible musician does next. 
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